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The Health, Social Care and Sport Committee is undertaking a short inquiry into winter 
preparedness and planning within health and social care. The aim of this inquiry is to review 
the effectiveness of last year’s winter preparedness plan Winter Resilience Overview 2022-
23 and make recommendations for the forthcoming 2023-24 winter plan. 
 

Committee questions and RCN Scotland responses  
 

Question 1 - Winter Resilience Overview 2022-23 

The staffing crisis facing Scotland’s health and care services has never been more 
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the previous year. While some investment in agency nursing will always be needed to cover 
unexpected events and ensure safe patient care, it is not the solution to the current 
workforce crisis and this level of spend is unsustainable.  
 
The Scottish Government Winter Resilience Overview focused on international recruitment 
to boost the NHS workforce over Winter 2022-23, with a target to recruit up to 750 
additional nurses, midwives and allied health professionals from overseas. While the 
Scottish Government has announced that this target has been exceeded, as of June 2023, 
less than 300 of these new internationally recruited staff were actually in post. Our 
internationally recruited nurses are, and always have been, invaluable to our health and 
care services. However, the numbers are small in the context of our workforce crisis and the 
process of recruitment and induction is not speedy. Against the background of a global 
nurse shortage, the Scottish Government’s focus must be on efforts to stop our 
experienced staff leaving and making nursing an attractive and rewarding career choice. 
 
In RCN Scotland’s The Nursing Workforce in Scotland Report, published in May, we 
highlight how expanding our nursing workforce must involve sustainable domestic 
recruitment and retention of our existing highly skilled and dedicated nursing staff. The 
report’s recommendations set out how the RCN believes these objectives can be achieved, 
including the need for the new Nursing and Midwifery Taskforce to deliver timely, 
sustainable and funded changes to address persistently high nursing vacancies. The 
Taskforce must look at how Scotland can retain experienced nursing staff, develop new 
routes into the profession and ensure nursing is a career of choice once again.  
 
The Health and Care (Staffing) (Scotland) Act, passed over 4 years ago, is due to come into 
force in April 2024. This groundbreaking legislation will only make a long-term positive 
difference if services have the nursing establishment they need. The high levels of nursing 
vacancies in health and social care need to be addressed as a matter of urgency ahead of 
implementation and an accurate, transparent baseline must be published before April 2024 
to enable trend data to emerge over time.  
 
In November 2022, RCN members in Scotland took the historic step of voting in favour of 
strike action to take a stand for their patients and their profession. Subsequent 
negotiations resulted in a pay offer that was narrowly accepted by members and secured 
the commitment to the Nursing and Midwifery Taskforce and a review of the Agenda for 
Change Framework. While RCN members voted in March to accept the Scottish 
government’s NHS pay offer by a narrow majority, a significant minority of members voted 
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The Nursing and Midwifery Taskforce, and the Review of Agenda for Change, are key 
opportunities to tackle, in a sustainable way, Scotland’s nursing workforce crisis. The 
Scottish Government must continue to prioritise these important initiatives and ensure that 
they deliver for Scotland’s nurses and those they care for.  
 

Long-term solutions to Scotland’s staffing crisis are needed, with proper workforce 
planning based on increasing population need. 
 

RCN Scotland response: 

Question 5 - Do you have anything else to tell us? 
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